
        
CHYMORAL PLUS 

 
For the use of a Registered Medical Practitioner or a Hospital or a Laboratory only 

Abbreviated Prescribing information for CHYMORAL PLUS (Trypsin-Chymotrypsin with Diclofenac 
potassium tablets) [Please refer the complete prescribing information available at 
www.torrentpharma.com] 
 
PHARMACOLOGICAL PROPERTIES: Trypsin and Chymotrypsin are proteolytic enzymes which 
have anti-inflammatory properties by following ways: Fibrinolytic activity, Reduction in Plasmin 
Inhibitor levels, Release of Intestinal Plasminogen activators, Increased Microcirculation and also 
Smoothens process of digestion. Diclofenac potassium is a nonsteroidal anti-inflammatory drug 
(NSAID) that exhibits anti-inflammatory, analgesic, and antipyretic activities. 
 
INDICATION: Acute or chronic osteoarthritis, rheumatoid arthritis and spondyloarthritis, spondylosis 
and other ortho-degenerative disorders, pain management, Post-operative wounds, Oedema, 
Haematoma, Prevention of inflammation of the stitching, Pelvic Inflammatory Disease, Caesarean 
section, Episiotomy, Hysterectomy, Tooth Extraction, Peri apical abscess, Maxillofacial surgery, 
Ocular Trauma such as Macular edema, Black eye, Hyphema, Uveal tract inflammation, 
Subconjunctival hemorrhage, Auricular Septal hematoma, Nasal fractures, Parapharyngeal abscess, 
Post-traumatic edema, soft tissue injury, Fractures & dislocation, Sports injury, Sprains & Strains, 
Intervertebral disc herniation, and Extra-ocular trauma. 
 
DOSAGE AND ADMINISTRATION: As directed by the Physician. The dose and dose frequency 
will be decided under the supervision of qualified physician. 
 
CONTRAINDICATION: Adjunctive therapy in management of inflammatory edema. 
Hypersensitivity to diclofenac, chymoral ingredients or enzymes. Chymoral is contraindicated in 
patients with severe liver, kidney impairment, peptic ulcer, high vitreous pressure, asthma, urticaria, or 
allergic-type reactions after taking aspirin or other NSAIDs, perioperative pain in the setting of 
coronary artery bypass graft (CABG) surgery and hypersensitivity.  
 
WARNINGS & PRECAUTIONS: When used for eye, it can cause increase in pressure in the eye 
and other eye conditions such as uveitis, paralysis of the iris, and keratitis. Not be employed in patients 
with severe hepatic insufficiency or renal damage or irregularities of blood clotting mechanism. To be 
used with caution during Lactation, or in the elderly, children, pregnancy, patients with irregularities of 
blood clotting mechanism, cardiovascular thrombotic events, hypertension, congestive heart failure 
and edema, risk of GI ulceration, bleeding, and perforation, anaphylactic reactions, skin reactions, 
hematological effects and preexisting asthma. 
 
DRUG INTERACTION: It can interact with voriconazole, Aspirin, methotrexate, cyclosporine, ACE 
inhibitors, furosemide, lithium, warfarin, systemic proteases, vitamins, minerals, herbal supplements, 
alcohol, antibiotics, chloramphenicol and anticoagulants 
 
ADVERSE REACTIONS: Hepatic damage, necrosis, arrhythmias, shivering, allergic reactions: 
itching, shortness of breath, swelling of the lips or throat, shock, loss of consciousness, and death, 
abdominal pain, constipation, diarrhea, dyspepsia, nausea, GI ulcers (gastric/duodenal) and vomiting, 
Abnormal renal function, anemia, dizziness, edema, fever, congestive heart failure, hypertension, dry 



mouth, esophagitis, ecchymosis, eosinophilia, weight changes, anxiety, asthenia, confusion, depression, 
asthma, dyspnea, alopecia, photosensitivity, blurred vision, cystitis, dysuria and renal failure. 
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