
TORLEVA XR 
 

For the use only of a Neurologist or a Hospital or a Laboratory 
Abbreviated Prescribing information for TORLEVA XR (Levetiracetam Extended 
Release Tablets 500 mg, 750 mg & 1000 mg) [Please refer the complete prescribing 
information available at www.torrentpharma.com] 
 
PHARMACOLOGICAL PROPERTIES: Antiepileptics. Levetiracetam is chemically 
unrelated to existing antiepileptic drugs (AEDs) and precise mechanism(s) by which 
levetiracetam exerts its antiepileptic effect is unknown. INDICATIONS: As adjunctive 
therapy in the treatment of partial onset seizures in adults with epilepsy. DOSAGE AND 
ADMINISTRATION: initiated with a dose of 1000 mg once daily. The daily dosage 
may be adjusted in increments of 1000 mg every 2 weeks to a maximum recommended 
daily dose of 3000 mg. WARNINGS & PRECAUTIONS: Psychiatric reactions, 
suicidal behavior and ideation, somnolence and fatigue, serious dermatological reactions, 
coordination difficulties, withdrawal seizures, hematologic abnormalities, blood pressure 
increases and exercise caution while seizure control during pregnancy. ADVERSE 
REACTIONS: Somnolence, asthenia, infection and dizziness, headache, pain, anorexia, 
depression, nervousness, ataxia, amnesia, anxiety, emotional lability, pharyngitis, cough 
increased, diplopia, aggression, nasal congestion, decreased appetite, irritability, ear pain, 
conjunctivitis, vomiting, abdominal pain, diarrhea, fall, arthralgia, sedation, abnormal 
behavior, agitation, mood altered, confusional state, vertigo, disturbance in attention, 
eczema, memory impairment, myalgia, abnormal liver function test, choreoathetosis, 
dyskinesia, erythema multiforme, hepatic failure, hepatitis, hyponatremia, leukopenia, 
neutropenia, pancreatitis, pancytopenia (with bone marrow suppression), alopecia. 
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